

BAC

FDP Form 10c - Bid Results on Consulting Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a - CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

CONSULTING SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON  
PROVINCE: BATAAN  
CITY/MUNICIPALITY:

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024  
QUARTER: 2

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Location	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
		NO BIDDED PROJECT FOR THE QUARTER							

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

  
AILEEN C. SAGUN  
BAC Secretariat

  
JEFFREY T. CALMA  
BAC Chairman



BAC

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.



GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT

REGION: REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON  
 PROVINCE: BATAAN  
 CITY/MUNICIPALITY:

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024  
 QUARTER: 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
GOODS-TF-005-2024	Purchase of Medicines to be use for Bagac Community and Medicare Hospital, Bataan	9,974,140.24	QUAD-GEN PHARMACEUTICAL	Deo Vincent C. Encinares 4496 Gov Padilla St., Plaridel,	1,115,420.72	April 8, 2024
			STERITEX MEDICAL SYSTEM	Cristin Sagum San Agustin, San Fernando City, Pampanga	400,418.27	
			MED-LINE DSITRIBUTOR	Reynold D. Paguirigan 400 National Highway Paringao, Bauang, La Union	127,940.00	
			SEAMMED PHARMA	Jason C. Almario Maria Clara, Mandaluyong City, Metro Manila	407,376.00	
GOODS-SEF-004-2024	Purchase of Uniform & Special Uniform for 2024 Palarong Pampook on April 27 - May 3, 2024, Bataan	8,532,070.00	APOLLO MERCHANDISE & LIGHTS & SOUNDS SYSTEM	Juanito De Leon 164 Hyperion St., Apollo, Orani, Bataan	8,526,760.00	April 15, 2024
GOODS-TF-006-2024	Purchase of Drugs and Medicines for the use of Orani District Hospital, Bataan from MAIFIP Program	10,374,278.34	STERITEX MEDICAL SYSTEM	Cristin Sagum San Agustin, San Fernando City, Pampanga	2,565,702.39	April 15, 2024
			QUAD-GEN PHARMACEUTICAL	Deo Vincent C. Encinares 4496 Gov Padilla St., Plaridel, Bulacan	1,519,608.95	
			SEAMMED PHARMA	Jason C. Almario Maria Clara, Mandaluyong City, Metro Manila	888,929.00	

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

**GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT**

**REGION:** REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON  
**PROVINCE:** BATAAN  
**CITY/MUNICIPALITY:**

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2024  
**QUARTER:** 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
GOODS-20%DF-001-2024	Purchase of Fully Automated Chemistry Analyzer Machine for the use of Orani District Hospital, Bataan	2,350,000.00	BERZAN ENTERPRISE	Glyzel A. Bermejo 37 Capitol Drive San Jose, Balanga City, Bataan	2,248,800.00	April 16, 2024
GOODS-TF-007-2024	Purchase of Medical Supplies for the use of Bagac Community and Medicare Hospital, Bataan	1,633,027.00	PRE-AN'S ENTERPRISES	Irma Cruz Aquino Street corner Del Pilar Street Davsan Subdivision	809,207.00	April 30, 2024
			BERZAN ENTERPRISE	Glyzel A. Bermejo 37 Capitol Drive San Jose, Balanga City, Bataan	596,378.50	
GOODS-TF-008-2024	Purchase of Drugs and Medicines for the use of Orani District Hospital from MAIFIP Program, Bataan	998,147.72	PRE-AN'S ENTERPRISES	Irma Cruz Aquino Street corner Del Pilar Street Davsan Subdivision Sindalan, San Fernando City,	26,942.00	April 30, 2024
			QUAD-GEN PHARMACEUTICAL	Deo Vincent C. Encinares 4496 Gov Padilla St., Plaridel, Bulacan	455,144.00	
GOODS-SEF-005-2024	Purchase of 2024 Brigada Eskwela Painting Materials, Bataan	5,456,646.00	GUNNARSSON CORPORATION	Evelyn E. Blanco 121 C Ramirez Bldg Quexon Ave. Cor. G. Araneta Santo Domingo, Quezon City, Metro Manila	5,391,664.00	May 2, 2024
GOODS-SEF-006-2024	Supply & Delivery of Ancillary Learning Resource Kits for K to 12 Pupils and Students of Bataan for the SY: 2024 - 2025	60,000,452.00	STRONGKING CORPORATION	John Lenard Balagosa Manikling St., Quezon City, Metro Manila	59,776,888.00	May 7, 2024



FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bidded project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

**GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT**

**REGION:** REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON  
**PROVINCE:** BATAAN  
**CITY/MUNICIPALITY:**

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2024  
**QUARTER:** 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
GOODS-GF-015-2024	Purchase of Drugs and Medicines for the use of JCPJMH, Bataan	7,619,057.83	STERITEX MEDICAL SYSTEM	Cristin Sagum San Agustin, San Fernando	1,851,338.00	May 7, 2024
			QUAD-GEN PHARMACEUTICAL	Deo Vincent C. Encinares 4496 Gov Padilla St., Plaridel, Bulacan	1,417,277.15	
			SEAMMED PHARMA	Jason C. Almario Maria Clara, Mandaluyong City, Metro Manila	303,726.00	
			BELASRAM FARMA TRADING	Merson C. Palma Apartment 2 No. 3 Purok 6 Feeder Road Snato Cristo, Guagua, Pampanga	111,031.11	
GOODS-TF-012-2024	Purchase of Medical Supplies for the use of Mariveles District Hospital, Bataan	1,214,957.50	BERZAN ENTERPRISE	Glyzel A. Bermejo 37 Capitol Drive San Jose, Balanga City, Bataan	1,173,619.75	May 15, 2024
GOODS-TF-011-2024	Purchase of Medical, Dental, X-ray and Laboratory Supplies for the use of Orani District Hospital from MAIFIP Program, Bataan	8,694,517.16	SANVEN MEDICAL ENT. INC.	Paul Wendell Pagdanganan B2 L10 Nevada St., Suburbia North Phase 2 Brgy. Malpitic, San Fernando City, Pampanga	3,703,555.00	May 20, 2024
			BERZAN ENTERPRISE	Glyzel A. Bermejo 37 Capitol Drive San Jose, Balanga City, Bataan	4,656,653.20	
GOODS-TF-014-2024	Purchase of Medicines to be use for Bagac Community and Medicare Hospital, Bataan	1,783,462.68	PANCO MEDICAL TRADING INC.	Cristin Sagum Dizon Estate, San Agustin, San Fernando City, Pampanga	1,445,875.50	May 29, 2024

FDP Form 10b - Bid Results on Goods and Services

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.

**GOODS AND SERVICES BID-OUT**

**REGION:** REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON  
**PROVINCE:** BATAAN  
**CITY/MUNICIPALITY:**

**CALENDAR YEAR:** 2024  
**QUARTER:** 2

Reference No.	Item Description	Approved Budget for Contract	Winning Bidder	Name and Address of Bidder	Bid Amount	Date of Bidding
GOODS-20%DF-002-2024	Purchase of Seedlings for Provincial Greening Program, Bataan	1,555,800.00	TR33 ENTERPRISE	May-An M. Umali 163 Balas, Talisay, Batangas	1,518,163.00	June 10, 2024
GOODS-TF-018-2024	Purchase of Medical Supplies for the use of Mariveles District Hospital, Bataan	432,539.00	PRE-AN'S ENTERPRISES	Irma Cruz Aquino Street corner Del Pilar Street Dausan Subdivision Sindalan, San Fernando City, Pampanga	410,400.00	June 24, 2024

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

  
**AILEEN T. SAGUN**  
 BAC Secretariat

  
**JEFFREY T. CALMA**  
 BAC Chairman

BAC

FDP Form 10a - Bid Results on Civil Works

Note: Bid Results are in three (3) separate forms, particularly, for Civil Works (Form 10a -CW), Goods and Services (Form 10b - GS) and Consulting Services (Form 10c - CS). If there is no bid project, good or service for the quarter, the forms must still be submitted with the said notation and signed accordingly.



CIVIL WORKS BID-OUT

REGION: REGION III - CENTRAL LUZON  
 PROVINCE: BATAAN  
 CITY/MUNICIPALITY:

CALENDAR YEAR: 2024  
 QUARTER: 2

No.	Reference No.	Name of Project	Approved Budget for Contract	Location	Winning Bidder	Name and Address	Bid Amount	Bidding Date	Contract Duration
1	INFRA-5%LDRRM-002-2024	Rehabilitation of Dike Barangay Balut II, Pilar, Bataan	4,877,652.75	Barangay Balut II, Pilar, Bataan	R.Z. TIGAS CONSTRUCTION & TRADING	Rolando Z. Tigas Munting Batangas, Balanga City, Bataan	4,865,719.82	April 1, 2024	90 Calendar Days
2	INFRA-SEF-009-2024	Rehabilitation of Sixteen (16) Classroom School Building Orani South ES, Orani, Bataan	18,981,552.41	Orani, Bataan	DELCO BUILDERS	Shaira Joy Balana Doña Maria, Balanga City, Bataan	18,919,333.11	April 4, 2024	150 Calendar Days
3	INFRA-SEF-009-2024	Construction Inclusive Learning Resource Center Dinalupihan Elementary School - Special Education Barangay Padre Dandan, Dinalupihan, Bataan	24,333,968.16	Barangay Padre Dandan, Dinalupihan, Bataan	E.R. VENZON CONSTRUCTION / DM BERNALES CONSTRUCTION (JV)	Drazel Bernales 39 Neptune Street, Orani, Bataan	24,272,897.51	April 4, 2024	180 Calendar Days
4	INFRA-SEF-008-2024	Rehabilitation of Six (6) Classroom School Building Saysain HS, Bagac, Bataan	5,431,146.74	Bagac, Bataan	AJA BUILDERS	John R. Teopengco J. Linao Rd, Bagac, Bataan	5,400,404.93	April 4, 2024	90 Calendar Days
5	INFRA-5%LDRRM-003-2024	Construction of Dike Barangay Ibis, Bagac, Bataan	4,876,988.17	Barangay Ibis, Bagac, Bataan	DAJ BUILDERS	Arsenio P. Flores Jr. Zamora St., Bagumbayan, Balanga City, Bataan	4,844,947.29	April 8, 2024	90 Calendar Days
6	INFRA-20%DF-002-2024	Improvement of Road Barangay Bo. Luz, Limay, Bataan	2,148,893.62	Barangay Bo. Luz, Limay, Bataan	NICAP CONSTRUCTION	Romeo L. Caparaz Block 1, Lot 14 Marinell Subdivision, Balanga City, Bataan	2,101,577.98	April 8, 2024	60 Calendar Days



7	INFRA-20%DF-003-2024	Rehab/Improvement of Pier Barangay Sabang, Morong, Bataan	4,877,723.30	Barangay Sabang, Morong, Bataan	W. ALLEN CONSTRUCTION	Joseph C. Panganiban Blk. 10 Lot 2 Ganzon Village Calaylayan, Abucay, Bataan	4,850,681.83	April 15, 2024	90 Calendar Days
8	INFRA-20%DF-003-2024	Improvement of Road Barangay Mt. View, Mariveles, Bataan	1,955,029.72	Barangay Mt. View, Mariveles, Bataan	CYPHRIAN BUILDERS & TRADING	John Cyphrian Escudero Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	1,935,752.92	April 15, 2024	60 Calendar Days
9	INFRA-20%DF-003-2024	Rehab/Improvement of Drainage System Barangay Centro I, Orani, Bataan	1,955,580.45	Barangay Centro I, Orani, Bataan	NICAP CONSTRUCTION	Romeo L. Caparaz Block 1, Lot 14 Marinell Subdivision, Balanga City, Bataan	1,930,606.28	April 15, 2024	60 Calendar Days
10	INFRA-SEF-010-2024	Rehabilitation of Sixteen (16) Classroom School Building Bataan School of Fisheries, Orion, Bataan	15,675,127.68	Orion, Bataan	VICTORIA BUILDERS & TRADING	Bryan Zabala Camia St., Venzon Subd., Cupang North, Balanga City, Bataan	15,625,950.89	April 16, 2024	150 Calendar Days
11	INFRA-20%DF-005-2024	Rehab / Improvement of Multi-Purpose Building Barangay Mambog, Hermosa, Bataan	4,876,413.27	Barangay Mambog, Hermosa, Bataan	ARG BUILDERS & TRADING	Arnel R. Gozon San Jose, Balanga City, Bataan	4,866,374.36	April 22, 2024	90 Calendar Days
12	INFRA-20%DF-005-2024	Improvement of Road Barangay West Daan Bago, Samal, Bataan	2,928,534.31	Barangay West Daan Bago, Samal, Bataan	RWD CONSTRUCTION	Reynaldo W. Del Rosario Cuaderno Avenue, Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	2,918,742.07	April 22, 2024	60 Calendar Days
13	INFRA-20%DF-004-2024	Improvement of Road Barangay Villa Angeles, Orion, Bataan	2,928,196.93	Barangay Villa Angeles, Orion, Bataan	NICAP CONSTRUCTION	Romeo L. Caparaz Block 1, Lot 14 Marinell Subdivision, Balanga City, Bataan	2,907,906.98	April 22, 2024	60 Calendar Days
14	INFRA-5%LDRRM-004-2024	Construction of Slope Protection Barangay Duale, Limay, Bataan	4,877,718.93	Barangay Duale, Limay, Bataan	LEBERN BUILDERS TRADING & GEN. SERVICES	Bernardo D. Flores Jr. 13 Magnolia St., Cupang North, Balanga City, Bataan	4,855,798.92	April 22, 2024	90 Calendar Days

15	INFRA-5%LDRRM-005-2024	Construction of Slope Protection Barangay Ibaba, Bagac, Bataan	4,877,327.16	Barangay Ibaba, Bagac, Bataan	ATP CONSTRUCTION	Alfredo T. Paguio Jr. Ma. Lourdes Subd., Balanga City, Bataan	4,853,497.15	April 30, 2024	90 Calendar Days
16	INFRA-TF-001-2024	Rehabilitation of the Philippine Rural Development Project (PRDP) Ice Plant with Cold Storage (Civil Works) in Mariveles, Bataan	1,463,172.12	Mariveles, Bataan	LEBERN BUILDERS TRADING & GEN. SERVICES	Bernardo D. Flores Jr. 13 Magnolia St., Cupang North, Balanga City, Bataan	1,452,994.39	May 2, 2024	45 Calendar Days
17	INFRA-TF-001-2024	Site Improvement of the Philippine Rural Development Project (PRDP) Multi Commodity Solar Tunnel Dryers in Orion, Bataan	1,269,838.94	Orion, Bataan	DM MADARANG CONSTRUCTION	Donald M. Madarang Josefville, Pilar, Bataan	1,260,026.68	May 2, 2024	60 Calendar Days
18	INFRA-SEF-011-2024	Rehabilitation of Seven (7) Classroom School Building Marina Bay ES, Mariveles, Bataan	6,429,304.27	Mariveles, Bataan	RCS CONSTRUCTION	Ramon C. Santos Yakal St. Panilao, Pilar, Bataan	6,410,008.64	May 6, 2024	90 Calendar Days
19	INFRA-20%DF-006-2024	Construction of Drainge System Barangay Batangas II, Mariveles, Bataan	1,953,134.07	Barangay Batangas II, Mariveles, Bataan	HORAMABI BUILDERS	Renedel R. Mendoza JJ Linao Road Ala-Uli, Pilar, Bataan	1,942,888.88	May 8, 2024	45 Calendar Days
20	INFRA-20%DF-006-2024	Construction of Drainge System Barangay Dangcol, Balanga City, Bataan	1,953,159.92	Barangay Dangcol, Balanga City, Bataan	HORAMABI BUILDERS	Renedel R. Mendoza JJ Linao Road Ala-Uli, Pilar, Bataan	1,942,738.04	May 8, 2024	45 Calendar Days
21	INFRA-20%DF-008-2024	Improvement of Drainage System Barangay Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	4,437,834.60	Barangay Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	DE JESUS CONSTRUCTION	Manolo M. De Jesus Sibacan Road, Balanga City, Bataan	4,415,185.39	May 27, 2024	75 Calendar Days
22	INFRA-SEF-012-2024	Construction of Two (2) Storey Ten (10) Classroom School Building Justice Emilio Angeles Gancayco MNHS Barangay Balagtas, Orion, Bataan	31,929,638.97	Barangay Balagtas, Orion, Bataan	R.Z. TIGAS CONSTRUCTION & TRADING	Rolando Z. Tigas Munting Batangas, Balanga City, Bataan	31,914,555.55	May 27, 2024	300 Calendar Days
23	INFRA-20%DF-009-2024	Improvement of Drainage System Barangay San Carlos, Mariveles, Bataan	2,849,384.75	Barangay San Carlos, Mariveles, Bataan	FAME BUILDER PHILIPPINES	Edilberto Pizarro 01 Gallardo St., Poblacion, Balanga City, Bataan	2,838,476.68	May 28, 2024	45 Calendar Days



24	INFRA-20%DF-007-2024	Upgrading of Road Barangay Tubo-Tubo, Dinalupihan, Bataan	1,855,324.65	Barangay Tubo-Tubo, Dinalupihan, Bataan	E.R. VENZON CONSTRUCTION	Noli A. Venzon Sunflower St., Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	1,848,888.88	May 28, 2024	60 Calendar Days
25	INFRA-20%DF-007-2024	Upgrading of Farm to Market Road Barangay Tanato, Balanga City, Bataan	1,952,630.18	Barangay Tanato, Balanga City, Bataan	BPQ CONSTRUCTION & TRADING	Baron Vic Quezon Molave St., Balanga City, Bataan	1,929,491.59	May 28, 2024	60 Calendar Days
26	INFRA-20%DF-009-2024	Rehab/Improvement of Multi-Purpose Building Barangay Bangkal, Abucay, Bataan	4,745,242.63	Barangay Bangkal, Abucay, Bataan	ATP CONSTRUCTION	Alfredo T. Paguio Jr. Ma. Lourdes Subd., Balanga City, Bataan	4,719,936.80	May 28, 2024	90 Calendar Days
27	INFRA-20%DF-010-2024	Rehabilitation / Improvement of Senior Citizen Building Barangay Saysain, Bagac, Bataan	2,291,358.12	Barangay Saysain, Bagac, Bataan	FAME BUILDER PHILIPPINES	Edilberto Pizarro 01 Gallardo St., Poblacion, Balanga City, Bataan	2,282,062.48	June 3, 2024	60 Calendar Days
28	INFRA-20%DF-014-2024	Improvement of Farm to Market Road Barangay San Antonio, Bagac, Bataan	1,953,979.20	Barangay San Antonio, Bagac, Bataan	P & V Construction & Sales	Corazon Panganiban Sampaguita St., Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	1,940,670.68	June 18, 2024	60 Calendar Days
29	INFRA-20%DF-012-2024	Construction of Concrete Irrigation Canal in Sitio Maluya, Barangay Cupang Proper, Balanga City, Bataan	829,952.99	Barangay Cupang Proper, Balanga City, Bataan	P & V Construction & Sales	Corazon Panganiban Sampaguita St., Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	819,544.35	June 18, 2024	45 Calendar Days
30	INFRA-20%DF-011-2024	Reblocking of Road Barangay Bayan, Orani, Bataan	1,951,713.71	Barangay Bayan, Orani, Bataan	FAME BUILDER PHILIPPINES	Edilberto Pizarro 01 Gallardo St., Poblacion, Balanga City, Bataan	1,941,483.04	June 19, 2024	45 Calendar Days
31	INFRA-SEF-013-2024	Construction of Four (4) Storey Sixteen (16) Classroom School Building Magsaysay NHS Barangay Magsaysay, Dinalupihan, Bataan	68,462,185.72	Barangay Magsaysay, Dinalupihan, Bataan	E.R. VENZON CONSTRUCTION	Noli A. Venzon Sunflower St., Doña Francisca, Balanga City, Bataan	68,440,676.11	June 19, 2024	180 Calendar Days

We hereby certify that we have reviewed the contents and hereby attest to the veracity and correctness of the data or information contained in this document.

  
AILEEN C. SAGUN  
BAC Secretariat

  
JEFFREY T. CALMA  
BAC Chairman